
A Sermon on the Taboos of Sexual Trauma 
Sermon by Rev. Minister Angela Smith of COPE for July 14th, 2024 (and beyond) 
 
Welcome to this week’s service.  Today I’m going to give my best argument for 
enforcing and enhancing penalties for genital mutilation regardless of gender of victim.  
The sources for what I’m about to say are available in the following posts (read full 
threads for all citations) to X if not cited within the sermon as written: 
https://twitter.com/heal247/status/1803068222087770416 and 
https://twitter.com/heal247/status/1804661636575506936 . 
 
Statistical Analysis of Health Risks Associated with Circumcision (Data from Google AI 
generated reports and search results including NIH, CDC and 
https://hpvcentre.net/statistics/reports/MAR_FS.pdf ) 
 
COUNTRY % OF MALES 

CIRCUMCISED 
(CUT) 

STI RATE OF 
ENTIRE MALE 
POPULATION 
(CUT & UNCUT) 
(INCLUDING HIV) 

PENILE CANCER 
RATE OF ENTIRE 
MALE 
POPULATION 
(CUT & UNCUT) 

Sweden 5% 0.31% 0.0021% 
Switzerland 5.9% 9.19% <0.001% 
USA 77-80% 20% <0.001% 
Vietnam 0.2% 17.3% 0.82% 
China 5-14% 7% 0.00042% 
United Kingdom 8.5-20.7% 1.397% 0.003% 
Morocco 99.9% 17.7% (5.7% with 

HIV) 
.07%  

 
The above establishes that circumcision does not prevent STIs (including HIV) nor penile 
cancer.  It also establishes that those claiming otherwise are misinformed and/or 
deliberately making false claims about any health benefits, where 200 baby boys die in 
the US from circumcision annually and health risks include cancer, prostate issues 
(narrowing urethra), and for some imminent death.  In terms of getting it for religious or 
cosmetic reasons, that is a throwback to slavery with the former and the vice of vanity 
with the latter suggesting the parent is a malignant narcissist or stupid and prone to 
superstition or otherwise unduly influenced by propaganda. 
 
If you support circumcision of healthy boys, you are evil and deserve the death penalty in 
my opinion.  If the law is not enforced properly to protect boys from genital mutilation 
because the US Supreme Court is majority Catholic, then I demand a new US Supreme 
Court.  For more on Catholicism and totalitarianism/authoritarianism/fascism, see 
https://www.cope.church/saviorsermon.pdf .  Please also understand that in addition to 
killing Martin Luther King Jr., John F. Kennedy, Abraham Lincoln and attempting to 
assassinate President Ronald Reagan, Catholic adherents are also responsible for killing 
John Lennon.  See the sermon on saviorism linked above in this paragraph for cited 
sources on all but Lennon’s killer though that is verifiable online.   



 
The male foreskin is the same part and has the same function as the female clitoris.  
Genital mutilation of girls and boys is the same exact procedure.  In the US, circumcision 
was most widely performed in the 1950s and incidents of rape and other violent crimes 
skyrocketed in the 1970s.  With the decline of the genital mutilation of baby boys, the 
decline of rape has followed and is down since the 1970s.  Circumcision of baby boys is 
done without anesthesia and no pain-killers following the butchery because they are too 
young for pain medication.  The Catholic Church’s current policy is double-speak and 
claims it should never be done unless medically necessary or to prevent disease.  They 
claim it prevents certain types of cancer.  The truth is that some studies suggest it 
prevents penile cancer in childhood but increases the risk of invasive penile cancer in 
adulthood.  The truth is also that less than 1% of men are ever diagnosed with any form 
of penile cancer.  And, if you are female and unable to imagine being genitally mutilated 
by way of having your clitoris removed with or without anesthesia and pain management, 
please ask yourself “If my doctor told me I needed a full mastectomy to prevent breast 
cancer which I only have a 13% chance of ever developing, would it be worth it to 
prevent breast cancer just in case?  If your answer is “no” to that, then that’s your answer 
on circumcision and the genital mutilation of baby boys too. 
 
Circumcised men are always uncomfortable as their packages don’t stay naturally moist 
as the foreskin protects and heals the penis.  So, while if they had their foreskin they 
would get wet for their partners, without it they are too dry.  The mouth, eyelid, and 
clitoris all have similar salivating glands and men who have been circumcised may need 
oral assistance before vaginal penetration.  The alternative is using artificial lubricant 
which is petroleum-based and bad for the environment.  In addition, women’s bodies 
react to a dry penis feeling unattractive or not attractive enough bringing the relationship 
into question resulting in over-compensation in the realm of physical augmentation, 
make-up, and the like.  Circumcised men know there is something wrong with them, but 
don’t always know the source of their suffering or how to properly address it.   
 
The Catholic Church via St. Thomas says the reason for circumcision is to kill the man 
and the only way to save him is if he dies before circumcision.  This is followed later by 
baptism in holy water being rebirthed as property of the church endowed now with the 
Holy Spirit.  The Catholic Church still recommends circumcision using double-speak by 
creating a loophole for it with prevention rather than solely as a result of medical 
necessity to save a life.   
 
I’m a peaceful woman who does not resort to violence.  I am a survivor of sexual assault 
and battery.  I was sodomized when I was 6 years old by a circumcised man.  I have 
always been committed to truth and virtue.  I wanted to know why anyone would do 
something so evil.  I’m sure they are wondering that themselves and when told it was 
God’s will by divine order of the Catholic Church that they were just trying to save me 
too since that’s how the Catholics do it and that man was Catholic, I found something to 
hate that I never thought I would.  So, I thank the Catholic Church for giving me 
something to hate for so many reasons including the assassinations of true American 
leaders and the apparent ritualistic murder of mankind for the purpose of enslavement.  I 



spent years not letting myself hate and practicing #TaoFu to prevent myself from being 
tempted to hate.  I refuse to dehumanize.  But, the Catholic Church isn’t a person, is it?  
It’s a remnant of a relic that should have died no later than 1381.   
 
Church or not, the US is a nation of laws.  Some have already been convicted of the 
crime of genital mutilation of females in the US.  I expect baby boys to get the same 
justice and protection even if grown men now with children of their own whether through 
criminal prosecution of their “doctors” or through the biggest class action lawsuit the US 
has ever seen.  If the genital mutilation doesn’t stop immediately, January 6th and 
September 11th will be long-forgotten and seem like nothing I imagine.  The root of all 
criminal violence is genital mutilation and it is time to cut it out.  There will be no over-
turning of that ban and the current criminalization of the procedure covering girls applies 
to boys too and always has or else the law needs correcting.  Do you want them to permit 
it on baby girls too? 
 
How I keep religious liberty intact and still see the US government banning the Catholic 
Church but not individual Catholics:  All churches must be sole proprietorships to be 
protected by the Bill of Rights because people are individuals who are collectively known 
as We The People in government documents recognizing each others' individual rights as 
encoded in the US Constitution.  Those who fail to respect the rights of any other 
individual are causing some legally recognized harm and therefore are subject to civil and 
criminal penalties where proven by a preponderance of the evidence or beyond a 
reasonable doubt.  There can be no more churches that fail to align with the law in 
regards to respect for individual rights and respect that all men are created equal and will 
be retaining the right to their full package.  See, the right to pursue happiness is an 
inalienable God-given right and genital mutilation prevents and/or hinders exercise 
thereof.   
 
I hope everyone enjoyed Independence Day and I expect everyone to act like they 
understand the US and French Revolutions were inspired by the Lollard Movement 
which came after the Peasant Revolt of 1381, which is where you’ll find our founding 
fathers at COPE.  Priest John Ball, Wat Tyler, and Priest/Professor John Wycliffe are the 
founding fathers of COPE.  Priest John Ball and Wat Tyler were executed by the Catholic 
Church (Archbishop of Canterbury) for leading the Peasant Revolt of 1381 and John 
Wycliffe died of natural causes but his remains were drawn and quartered, burned, and 
the ashes scattered in the River Swift.  The Catholic Church did that to COPE’s founding 
fathers for demanding an end to forced tithing.  Are you awake yet?  
 
SPECIAL NOTE: You may also wish to see this thread: 
https://twitter.com/heal247/status/1808879206081909019 .  Circumcision AKA genital 
mutilation can result in excess loss of blood, infection, severe untreatable pain depending 
on age of victim, penile injury, inclusion cysts (which may become malignant epidermal 
inclusion cysts/cancerous), meatal stenosis (Meatal stenosis is an abnormal narrowing of 
the urethral opening (meatus). If the narrowing becomes significant, urine will trouble 
flowing from the bladder and may cause the bladder to not empty completely. If left 
untreated, this can lead to urinary tract infections and kidney problems.), and going for a 



specific aesthetic amounts to elective cosmetic surgery with serious health risks that 
imperil and forever impact the overall health and wellness of the victims/survivors.  
Genital mutilation/circumcision is a crime when done to girls.  “Female genital 
mutilation (FGM) has been a federal crime in the United States since 1996.”  
https://www.justice.gov/opa/pr/justice-department-and-federal-partners-recognize-zero-
tolerance-day-female-genital-
0#:~:text=FGM%20is%20a%20form%20of,the%20purpose%20of%20performing%20F
GM.  Equal protection makes it a crime where boys are the victims too.  Please demand 
prosecution to the fullest extent and end the maiming now. 
 
FINAL NOTE: Source: 
https://www.academia.edu/7151881/Circumcision_Serial_Killing_and_Criminal_Behavi
or_in_American_Medical_Violence  See Screenshot on following page or visit article. 

 
 
For those interested in starting #TaoFu Self-Defense Exercises, please see 
https://www.cope.church/taofu.htm and begin at any time. 
 
There are opportunities to send messages, receive mystery bonus blessings, and more 
with or without donating available now on our "Pass the Basket" page at 
https://www.cope.church/basket.htm . Thank You. 
 
"And ye shall know the truth, and the truth shall make you free." John 8:32 KJV Willful 
blindness is an abomination. 
 



COPE accepts Feedback, critical and complimentary. Learn more at 
https://www.cope.church/feedback.htm . For the sake of keeping myself and others 
humble, a sense of humor is welcome on all sides. 


